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In Sarah Collins’s mind, only one thing stands in the way of her success . . . an unborn baby.

Sarah is about to receive a promotion that will give her everything she’s ever wanted: a huge pay increase, a
new car, a fabulous apartment, and first-class travel.

But then she discovers she’s pregnant. And while she thinks she loves her boyfriend, Matt, she isn’t sure he’s
mature enough to be a responsible father. And the job she’s pursuing is open only because the previous
employee is out on maternity leave. Sarah would never be able to handle the travel as a single mom.

Torn between advice from her coworkers, the insistence of her mother and sister that she keep the baby, her
insecurity about her relationship with Matt, and the void where her father should be, Sarah has no idea how
to make this decision.

A Christmas card from a mysterious old woman is the catalyst for three visions of her future—and just may
be the miracle she needs. But can she trust the visions? Are they the yearnings of a conflicted heart? Or are
they true visions from the God she thought had turned His back on her?

For every woman who has made painful decisions, Sarah’s Choice offers comfort, wisdom and hope.

"This story provides a bit of encouragement and hope to those facing a difficult decision." —Romantic
Times, 4-star review

 

"A thought-provoking and stirring story of painful choices and their ramifications. For any woman who has
had to make a difficult decision, this book . . . will provide inspiration, hope, and solace to battered souls."
—Library Journal



"Written with deep compassion, gentle humor, and incredible insight." —CBA Retailers + Resources
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From reader reviews:

Donna Macdonald:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Sarah's Choice will make you to
end up being smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of
you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can be
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suitable book with you?

John Buckner:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline Sarah's Choice
suitable to you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. Typically the book untitled
Sarah's Choiceis the main one of several books that everyone read now. That book was inspired many men
and women in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new shape that you ever know ahead
of. The author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to understand the core
of this publication. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. To help you
to see the represented of the world with this book.

Sherry Ellis:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find reserve that need more time to be go through. Sarah's Choice can be your answer mainly because it can
be read by you who have those short free time problems.

Delores Villarreal:

The book untitled Sarah's Choice contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains her idea with easy
technique. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The
book was written by famous author. The author provides you in the new period of time of literary works. It is
easy to read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the
book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site as
well as order it. Have a nice study.
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